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Introduction

Problem statement

The general health status of  South African population appear sat-
isfactory until the statistics are broken down by population group, 
socioeconomic status as well as provinces [1]. Socio-economic is-
sues such as poverty and persistent inequalities in access to health 
services reflects disparities in the health status of  individuals par-
ticularly in the rural areas [2]. The Eastern Cape is one of  the 
nine provinces of  South Africa and is located south-east part of  
the country. The Eastern Cape Province is one of  the poorest 

provinces in South Africa in terms of  average monthly household 
expenditure [1, 2]. The province also has the lowest proportion of  
people living in formal housing (46.9%), with access to electricity 
(31.3%), and with the lowest proportion of  households with tap 
water inside the dwelling (24.4%). Moreover, less than 17% of  the 
population depending on labour income and 26% of  the poverty 
among households depending on labour income [3].

One of  the health concerns associated with the low socio-eco-
nomic status in the Eastern Cape is adolescent pregnancies. Ado-
lescent pregnancy can be described as pregnancy that occurs in 
girls from puberty to the age of  19 [4]. Adolescent pregnancy 
remains public health concern in South Africa and more com-
mon amongst young African and coloured women in rural areas 
[2]. Over the years the highest proportion of  under-18 deliveries 
was in the Eastern Cape and the lowest in Gauteng province. The 
proportion of  women under the age of  18 who ever gave birth 
nationally was 8.2%, 8.0%, 7.0% and 7.8% in 2011, 2012, 2013 
and 2014 respectively. Despite the declining trend in the average 
birth-rate, the proportion in the Eastern Cape remains high. The 
proportion of  women under the age of  18 who ever gave birth re-
corded for the Eastern Cape was 10.6%, 10.6%, 10.0% and 10.1% 
in 2011, 2012, 2013 and 2014 respectively [5].

Consequences of  unwanted adolescent pregnancies

Early pregnancy and child birth increases the health risk for the 
mother and the baby and may affect the health, social and eco-
nomic well-being of  society at large. Adolescents who become 
pregnant below the age of  18 are at a higher risk of  dying during 
childbirth than older women due to obstetric complications such 
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as haemorrhage, pregnancy-related infections and complications 
of  hypertension [6]. Complicated births such as caesarean section 
deliveries are also common amongst adolescents mainly due to 
underdeveloped pelvises which may lead to obstructed labour. In 
developing countries, medical services for a caesarean section may 
not be available resulting in infant mortality or maternal deaths 
[7-9]. Furthermore, adolescent mothers have an increased risk of  
premature and prolonged labour, miscarriages and stillbirths [10]. 
Infants of  adolescent mothers generally have low birth weights 
and are at an increased risk of  foetal growth retardation and peri-
natal deaths [11, 12]. The socio-economic consequences of  ado-
lescent pregnancy are also massive as schooling is interrupted and 
early parenthood is likely to affect adversely educational achieve-
ment with significant employment and socio-economic implica-
tions [13, 14]. Therefore efforts to reduce adolescent pregnancy 
are central to the promotion of  women’s educational, social, and 
economic development.

Contextualizing adolescent pregnancies

The context of  adolescent pregnancies differs depending on the 
setting. Adolescent pregnancies may be intended or unintended.
Intended pregnancies are common in adolescents in some devel-
oping countries and are usually in the context of  marriage or a 
recognizable union [15]. In these developing countries, some girls 
are still expected to marry and begin childbearing in their early or 
middle adolescent years based on traditional practices and norms, 
before they are physically or mentally ready to do so [16]. In Ken-
ya, for example, early marriage and early childbearing, especially 
in the rural areas, are common as adolescent girls are sanctioned 
and encouraged to do so by families and the wider community 
[17]. Intended pregnancies may also occur outside a recognizable 
union where young women have their first baby in the middle or 
late teenage years [18]. Motivations for such behaviour are differ-
ent, for example in South Africa, pressure from families or male 
partners to prove a woman’s fertility has often contributed to early 
childbearing as a woman cannot get married until she has had at 
least one child [19, 20]. The absence of  disincentives to prevent 
early childbearing, such as no alternatives for education or em-
ployment, has also led to adolescent pregnancies in this context 
[21].

Unintended pregnancies amongst adolescents are usually in the 
context of  outside of  marriage or a recognizable union, and often 
carry a social stigma in many communities and cultures [22]. Such 
pregnancies occur in adolescents who become sexually active at 
an early age when they do not know how to avoid unwanted preg-
nancies. They often lack access to sexual and reproductive health 
services and contraceptives that they need to avoid pregnancies 
[23]. Even if  they have access to such services, girls and young 
women are often powerless to insist on their use in relationships. 
In South Africa, factors such as gender inequalities may contribute 
to unwanted adolescent pregnancy. In some communities women 
are placed in a subordinate position according to the societal hi-
erarchy which leaves women with little or no negotiating power 
in sexual acts in a relationship [20]. Gender-based violence due to 
their subordinate position may also contribute to unwanted preg-
nancies in adolescents such that adolescent girls may be unable to 
refuse unwanted sex or to resist coerced sex [14, 20, 24].

Young school girls may also engage in sex with older partners in 
exchange for gifts or money, resulting in them having little or no 

negotiating power with their partners to insist on condom us-
age [22]. The problem of  pregnancies in adolescence should be 
viewed within the broader socio-economic-cultural environment 
in which adolescents operate. For instance, lack of  parental guid-
ance and counselling on issues of  sexuality and sex education is 
reinforced by cultural taboos that inhibit such discussions [25]. 
These culturally engrained practices cannot be solved by tradi-
tional sex education alone but also require culturally sensitive 
health promotion.

Culture sensitive health promotion

Health behaviour theories used in public health and health pro-
motion often ascribe poor health outcomes to an individual’s ac-
tion or inaction or unwillingness to heed preventative health mes-
sages. Recently researchers have focused on the role of  culture in 
health promotion by applying it to existing socio-behavioural vari-
ables in order to develop health-related interventions for positive 
health outcomes [26, 27]. Health promotion activities, whether 
targeted at individuals or communities, are difficult tasks, because 
culture creates unique patterns of  beliefs and perceptions of  the 
meaning of  health and these may have an impact on the out-
comes of  health promotion activities. Culture can be described as 
a system of  related values, concepts, meanings and beliefs active 
enough to influence the judgment, communication and behaviour 
of  an individual [28, 29]. Culture therefore shapes perceptions 
and practices of  individuals with regard to health and mediates 
responses to health information. To change health behaviours, 
promotion of  positive health behaviours within the cultural logic 
of  its contexts is of  importance. De Walt et al. suggested that 
careful implementation of  culturally sound methods in delivering 
health services has an impact in reducing the gap between culture 
and health promotion [30, 31].

The PEN-3 cultural model

The PEN-3 model examines cultural meanings such as beliefs and 
values of  health behaviour that have gained a central location in 
framing people’s relationships with health in social and cultural 
contexts. The three domains of  the PEN-3 model incorporate re-
lationships and expectations, cultural empowerment, and cultural 
identity. Each domain incorporates three individual constructs 
and the name PEN-3 is derived from the acronyms of  the con-
cepts of  each of  these constructs [32].

The Relationship and expectations domain focuses on the be-
haviour of  an individual, resources and influence of  family and 
friends in making health-related decisions but from a point of  
view of  how cultures define the roles of  persons and their ex-
pectations in the family and community relationships. The con-
struction and interpretation of  behaviour is usually based on the 
interaction between the perception of  that behaviour, resources 
that enable or constrain the actions, and the influence of  family, 
friends and social structures in nurturing the behaviour. Cultural 
empowerment domain is based on the belief  that culture rep-
resents a range of  good (Positive), indifferent (Existential) and 
negative (Negative), therefore interventions should focus not only 
on the bad influence of  culture but also on promoting the good. 
The Cultural identity domain defines the target population and 
suggests that interventions can take place at an individual (Per-
son), Extended family or Neighbourhood levels [32-34].
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Aim of  the study

The aim of  this study was to assess factors could contributing to 
adolescent pregnancy in three rural communities in the Eastern 
Cape. The results in this study will inform on a strategy to imple-
ment activities aimed at preventing teenage pregnancies.

Ethical considerations

Prior permission to conduct the study was obtained from the Fac-
ulty of  Pharmacy Ethics Committee, Rhodes University and the 
Eastern Cape Department of  Health.

Method

Guided by the PEN-3 cultural model and Community based par-
ticipatory principles, an explorative qualitative research design was 
undertaken with 13 Community Care Workers (CCWs) working 
with two non-governmental organisations (NGOs) in Glenmore 
and Ndwayana, and a field worker from Grahamstown. As the 
first phase of  an ongoing study, semi-structured interviews were 
carried out with each of  the participants to determine factors 
affecting adolescent pregnancies from a cultural point of  view. 
The interviews were conducted by the researcher in English and 
a translator was used in order to accommodate participants who 
were not familiar with the English language or might feel more 
comfortable expressing themselves in isiXhosa. The translator 
was used to translate from English to isiXhosa, which is one of  
the official languages of  South Africa, and vice versa. Each in-
terview took 20-30 minutes and 14 interviews were conducted. 
Note-taking was used to collect data and interview responses 
were recorded. The voice recordings from the semi-structured in-
terviews were translated and transcribed. The data was then man-
aged using NVIVO® 2010 and analysed according to the domains 
of  the PEN-3 model.

Results

Perceptions

The perceptions construct of  the relationship and expectations 
domain refers to the knowledge, attitudes, values, and beliefs af-
fecting personal, family, and community motivation to change be-
haviour. Positive perceptions are the knowledge, attitudes and/or 
beliefs that positively influence healthy decisions with regard to 
early sexual debut and contraceptive use amongst adolescents and 
in the community. For example, knowledge of  the consequences 
of  early pregnancy may influence the age of  sexual debut of  an 
individual. Responses that negatively affected decisions about 
contraceptive use or knowledge and beliefs that influenced early 
sexual debut were categorised as negative perceptions.

Fears about contraceptive use (negative): The community 
care workers expressed concern about adolescents’ non-adher-
ence to contraceptive therapy, especially with regard to hormonal 
injections. The adolescents perceive the hormonal injection to 
cause a weight gain, leading to non-adherence to the contracep-
tive therapy.

“The problem is that they say they don’t want to use contracep-
tion because they don’t want their bodies to become jelly like, 
that’s the problem. They always say no I’m using a condom, but 

still they’re falling pregnant.”P4

The community care workers identified the male condom and the 
hormonal injection as the main methods of  contraception used 
amongst the adolescents. The CCWs also reported that the female 
condom was unpleasant to use because of  its size.

“…so the girls are scared of  the female condoms, they are big so 
they are scared.”P14

Knowledge on factors contributing to and the consequences 
of  adolescent pregnancies (positive): From the responses of  
the CCWs, it was evident that CCWs had knowledge of  factors 
contributing to adolescent pregnancies in their community, for 
example peer pressure.

“The main causes of  teenage pregnancy is peer pressure and oth-
ers do not want to come to the clinic for family planning because 
not that they are scared but because of  peer pressure, if  one stops 
coming to the clinic the other will not come.”P10

CCWs also had knowledge of  the consequences of  early child-
birth, for example the disruption of  schooling, and the possible 
health effects, such as the risk of  getting cervical cancer.

“I tell them that having a baby while they’re still kids themselves 
is not great because once they have a responsibility of  a child they 
won’t be able to go to school.”P8

“When a child falls pregnant at an early age, they are at a risk of  
getting cervical cancer.”P9

Community concern for the welfare of  teenage girls (posi-
tive/negative): The CCWs are concerned about the socio-eco-
nomic welfare of  teenage girls if  they were to fall pregnant in 
their adolescent years as they perceive they are still young to be 
involved in sexual activity and are expected to be in school (posi-
tive). However, they also reported contrasting feelings with regard 
to teenage pregnancy in the community: some members of  the 
community are concerned for the welfare of  pregnant adoles-
cents whereas some are not concerned (negative).

“I feel bad because falling pregnant at a young age makes life dif-
ficult, because now the child stops going to school in order to take 
care of  the baby and they do not even have jobs.”P6

“They still get shocked because the girl would still be young and 
expected to be in school.”P13

“They actually don’t care, they don’t really pay attention to 
them.”P4

Knowledge on the importance of  contraceptive use (posi-
tive): CCWs have knowledge of  the advantages of  using contra-
ceptives amongst women and men in the community in prevent-
ing pregnancies and HIV/AIDS. They also reported that the use 
of  contraceptives in the community was an acceptable practice 
which has been put into practice in their health promotion activi-
ties conducted in the community.

“Yes I talk to them, I explain to them that it is important to use a 
condom whenever one is engaging in sexual activities to protect 
against HIV/AIDS and pregnancy.”P8
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“I always encourage them to go for family planning because it’s 
their future we are concerned about and that the first important 
thing in life is to go to school but they do not go for family plan-
ning and they also don’t want to use condoms.”P7

Early sexual debut as unacceptable(positive): From the re-
sponses of  CCWs, teenagers are perceived as too young for sexual 
activities (positive). However, this perception does not prevent 
teenagers from engaging in sexual activities but prevents them 
from accessing contraceptive methods from the clinic.

“I think they see it [sexual activity amongst teenagers] as a prob-
lem because they don’t want even a 10 year old to come here to 
collect condoms or 12 years old to use injection because it’s early 
to have sex.”P14

Cultural barriers related to communication about sex-relat-
ed matters (negative): CCWs reported that talking about sex 
and sexuality in the community is generally not common as they 
perceive it as encouraging teenagers into early sexual debut.

“Parents are not so keen on talking about such things [sex].”P6 

“Oh no ways, no one wants to talk about it [sex] in the commu-
nity, even if  you happen to pay someone a visit and the topic [sex] 
comes up and you encourage them to talk to their children about 
it, they say there is no way they could talk to their children about 
such things, if  you do you would be teaching them ‘wrong/bad’ 
things.”P9 

Enablers

This construct refers to the cultural, societal, systematic or struc-
tural forces affecting change in an individual or the community. 
This applies to resource availability, access, referrals, government 
officials, skills and services. Positive enablers refer to resources 
and institutional support that are beneficial and support adoles-
cents in making healthy decisions to prevent adolescent pregnan-
cy, for example, the availability of  and access to health services 
at clinics. Negative enablers are unsupportive structures for the 
adolescents that may facilitate risky sexual behaviour amongst the 
adolescents, such as media.

Availability of  community care workers (positive): CCWs are 
community members who serve and respond to the health needs 
of  the community. The main aim is to increase and improve the 
community’s access to relevant health information. The CCWs 
conduct health promotion activities in TB, HIV/AIDS and some-
times adolescent pregnancy. When asked to describe their jobs, 
two of  the participants responded:

“I go into the township, do home visits, when I arrive I introduce 
myself  and tell them I’m bringing the health service to them as 
the government has seen that people in the community are strug-
gling and some are being abused by their husbands or children are 
also being abused and they have hired us to go to the people.”P12

“I look after sick people, check if  children who are supposed to 
be in school or crèche that they actually go, to help those who 
eligible for social grant to get it, to get treatment from the clinic 
for those who are very sick and unable to get it themselves”. P13

Availability of  health care services (positive/negative): 
There is one clinic in Glenmore, one in Ndwayana, and 6 clin-
ics in the Grahamstown area (positive). Ndwayana and Glenmore 
rural communities are economically less developed compared to 
other towns in South Africa, and access to the clinics is difficult 
for most community members as they live far away from the 
clinic and rely on donkey carts to get them to the clinics. Some 
of  the people have to walk long distances to get health care ser-
vices (negative). There are no pharmacies nearby offering health 
services to the Ndwayana and Glenmore communities (negative). 
This will impact on the motivation to visit the clinics for family 
planning services and may be the reason for defaulting contracep-
tive therapy.

The clinics are structured so that certain chronic conditions such 
as tuberculosis (TB), HIV/AIDS, hypertension and diabetes 
are only attended to on a certain day of  the week. For example, 
Wednesday is an Antenatal Care day, and Tuesdays is an HIV pa-
tients review and patients come for their monthly medicine sup-
plies. This structure is not convenient for adolescents who want 
to come and get condoms or other contraceptives as there is no 
day set for family planning. Adolescents are scared of  the stigma 
associated with the different conditions, especially HIV/AIDS 
(negative).

“Teenagers are not free to go to the clinic for anything whether it 
is contraceptives or in general if  they are sick because of  the days 
that are scheduled for different chronic illnesses eg hypertension, 
diabetes and HIV. Tuesday is set aside for HIV and Wednesday 
for ANC therefore going on those days means you are pregnant 
or have HIV, and its not fair, the support structures in the clinics 
is not helping.”P1

Access to contraceptives (positive): Different contraceptive 
methods are offered at the clinics, namely condoms, hormonal 
injection, birth control tablets and sub-dermal hormonal implant. 
The community care workers identified the male condom and 
the hormonal injection as the common methods of  contracep-
tion amongst the adolescents. These methods are freely available 
at the clinics, and sometimes condoms are distributed by CCWs 
when they visit the communities. However the CCWs reported 
that only a few adolescents request condoms.

“Every child comes and takes the condoms from there [pointing 
at the reception area], in front it’s not a problem…There are only 
a few that come, you see the same faces all the time most of  them 
do not actually come.”P2

Health promotion activities in the community (positive/
negative): Health promotion activities organised by loveLife and 
the Ubunye Foundation are conducted in the community hall 
with the help of  CCWs. These activities are aimed at educating 
the communities on health-related issues such as TB and HIV 
(positive).

“At school they do talk about sex, there’s also someone from love-
Life, he also comes and talks to them about such things.”P6

However, there is a lack of  health promotion materials developed 
for the prevention of  adolescent pregnancy, and if  available there 
are in English which most people do not comprehend as they are 
isiXhosa first language speakers (negative).
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“In my opinion or suggestion, I was thinking this booklet is meant 
for teenagers but even in those teenagers others are not good in 
English, so I was thinking of  what about you write in English 
and isiXhosa even two piece booklets... even us as ccw some it is 
difficult to read in English if  I read in isiXhosa it will be easier 
to explain to teenagers but if  you give me this English book even 
me I do not understand what is here and they will be asking me 
questions so it will be difficult for me to answer because I do not 
understand.”P14

Child Support Grant (negative): The CCWs identified the 
Child Support Grant (CSG) as a contributory factor to adolescent 
pregnancy. The government implementation of  the CSG has a 
negative influence on teenagers as they willingly fall pregnant to 
receive the monetary stipend every month.

“They actually want the social grant, so they do fall pregnant 
deliberately.”P10

“Another thing is the social grant, they think that if  one has a baby 
and therefore get the social grant, they actually have money.”P8

Religion (negative/positive): Most of  the community mem-
bers in Grahamstown, Glenmore and Ndwayana are members of  
mostly Christian denominations. The church as an institution is 
an enabler and church doctrines and norms fall under the nurtur-
er construct because of  the influence on the individual, family and 
the community. It is further classified as both positive and nega-
tive under the community empowerment domain. Under certain 
doctrines, sex before marriage is forbidden which influences how 
children are expected to behave (positive). However some doc-
trines do not allow the use of  contraceptives or sex education in 
any way, which may hinder the use of  contraceptives amongst the 
adolescents, and even if  they wanted to they may not have enough 
information (negative).

“We would like to talk about prevention of  pregnancy but it is 
difficult because of  religious beliefs that you are not supposed to 
talk about sex until you get married or preventing pregnancy.”P1

Socio-economic status (negative): As described by the CCWs, 
the three communities are characterised by poor socioeconomic 
conditions such as unemployment and poverty. The CCWs sug-
gested that most adolescent pregnancies were from children being 
taken care of  by a single parent or their parents were adolescents 
when they gave birth to their children. The socio-economic status 
of  the community was also identified as a contributory factor to 
adolescent pregnancy as adolescents sought financial security and 
support from older men resulting in cross-generational relation-
ships. This also contributed directly to adolescents willingly falling 
pregnant in order to receive the child support grant.

“Most of  these kids usually date people who are older than them, 
so I would say for some of  them it is poverty related. They date 
these older men because they need money.”P7

“Well it concerns me because you find that the child is quite young 
and is from a very disadvantaged family where no one works and 
they struggle to even buy food.”P13

Media (negative): The CCWs identified the negative impacts of  
media on contributing to adolescent pregnancy. They suggested 
that what children see on the television, magazines and the inter-
net influences the behaviour and practices of  adolescents.

“Some of  them see it [sex] on TV and then they want to try it 
out.”P6
Access to shebeens(negative): The communities have no or-
ganised instructive activity during their free time, such as during 
weekends and holidays, which make them vulnerable to activities 
that expose them to adolescent pregnancy. One of  the activities 
undertaken by adolescents is going to shebeens where they are 
exposed to older men and alcohol.

“Well on weekends, even this football thing is new because they 
don’t usually have anything [to do]. But they do go to these nice 
things, to Shebeens or Tavern, even the underage ones go.”P3

Nurturers

This construct refers to the degree to which attitudes, beliefs and 
actions are influenced, mediated and nurtured by extended family, 
kin, friends and the community. Responses which showed sup-
port from family members and friends regarding healthy sexual 
decisions were classified as positive nurturers. Negative nurtur-
ers are the unsupportive partners, family members and significant 
others who negatively influence healthy sexual behaviour. The 
main people that were found to have significant influence on the 
community are parents, friends and community care workers.

Parents (negative): The CCWs identified that a lack of  parental 
supervision on children’s activities and their actions significantly 
influence the behaviours of  children. One of  the respondents 
said:

“I think that another cause lies with the parents, because they are 
also young parents and are not as responsible. For instance I have 
my child, sometimes let’s say I will go out at night and sleep at my 
boyfriend’s/husband place. During that time, there is no one to 
watch her and to ensure that she sleeps at home. I can take care 
of  her during the day and ensure that she is at home but at night 
if  I go out, then no one does. I think that’s where the problem 
lies, because these children are also parented by young parents as 
well.”P5

“It makes me wonder if  anyone cares at home. Because as a par-
ent you have to be there, you have to show that you care.”P12

The role of  parents in the community as perceived by the CCWs 
is to inform and educate adolescents on issues regarding sexuality 
and reproductive health. However, the CCWs expressed concern 
about parents not educating their children as ‘sex talk’ is not an 
easy topic to discuss or they are too shy. Despite their concern, 
some mothers still talk to their children about sex in spite of  cul-
tural restrictions.

“Parents are not so keen on talking about such things [sex].”P6

“Even if  you happen to pay someone a visit and the topic comes 
up and you encourage them to talk to their children about it, they 
say there is no way they could talk to their children about such 
things [sex], if  you do you would be teaching them ‘wrong/bad’ 
things.”P9

Due to the socio-economic status of  the communities, the social 
setup in terms of  the living conditions can affect the behaviour 
of  the child:
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“Most children do not live with their fathers and mothers and may 
have boyfriends who come home with and the children see these 
things and also want to practice it; the houses are small therefore 
they share rooms with parents and also want to practice what their 
parents are doing and most parents do not think of  that.”P1

Friends/peers (negative): The CCWs identified friends (peer 
pressure) as having a great influence on the decisions made by 
adolescents with regard to contraceptive use as well as in sexual 
debut. They noticed a trend in peer groups where an individu-
al had fallen pregnant and her friends would also fall pregnant. 
Within these peer groups, the CCWs identified difference in age 
groups resulting in the young girls imitating the behaviours of  the 
older groups.

“I think it’s peer pressure or some form of  competition. Because 
once one of  them falls pregnant, the others follow suit.”P10

“Children become friends with people from a different age group, 
older girls and they all party together.”P5

Partners/boyfriends (negative): Most children engage in sex-
ual activity with older men or boys in order to get financial secu-
rity. This may lead to coerced sex or obligatory sex to return the 
favour.

“Most of  these kids usually date people who are older than them, 
so I would say for some of  them it is poverty related. They date 
these older men because they need money.”P7

Discussion

Adolescent pregnancy is still a public health concern in South 
Africa, and the study explored factors affecting adolescent preg-
nancy in rural communities from a cultural point of  view. The 
main findings indicated that adolescent pregnancy is a significant 
cause for concern in the communities under study and identi-
fied health seeking behaviours with respect to contraceptive use, 
availability of  sexual and reproductive health services and influ-
ence of  family and peers as the dominant factors contributing to 
adolescent pregnancies. Perceptions such as fears of  weight gain 
due to hormonal contraceptive use and the size of  the female 
condoms had a negative influence on the use of  contraceptives 
amongst adolescents. These perceptions are comparable to those 
that emerged from studies on factors influencing non-utilisation 
of  contraceptives in rural communities in South Africa [35, 36]. 
Ramathuba et al. [36] identified that teenage pregnancies were a 
result of  a lack of  knowledge about contraception and miscon-
ceptions such as weight gain, infertility and watery discharge. The 
condom was cited by the majority as their preferred contraceptive 
method, whereas the hormonal contraceptives (the injection and 
the pill) were least preferred. The overall result is low contracep-
tive use amongst adolescents leading to increased rates of  teenage 
pregnancies.

Conventional theories of  behaviour change often focus on in-
dividual perceptions to promote change. The PEN-3 cultural 
model, however, focuses on the impact of  culture on health be-
liefs and actions, and proposes that public health and health pro-
motion should focus not only on the individual, but also on the 
cultural context that nurtures a person’s health behaviour in his or 
her family and community [32, 33]. The model was therefore used 
to identify factors contributing to adolescent pregnancies in the 

socio-economic-cultural context in which they occur. From the 
results, decisions about contraceptive use are affected by the lack 
of  access to health services and the influence of  family, friends 
and other stakeholders in the community. The current study also 
showed that although clinics provide free contraceptives to the 
community and community care workers encourage preventing 
early childbearing, the decision to use contraceptives and debut 
of  sexual activity is influenced by the distances from the clinics 
to their homes and the health services provided. This concurs 
with the results reported by Ritcher and Mlambo [37] that in ru-
ral communities, although clinics are available, transport to the 
health services becomes a barrier to the accessibility of  the health 
services. In addition to lack of  access to health services, there 
was a lack of  health promotion material such as pamphlets in 
the appropriate language, leading to lack of  access to information 
regarding sexual and reproductive health. The current study iden-
tified that the health promotion material was available in English 
which the adolescents and the local community members could 
not understand. Ritcher and Mlambo [37] also identified language 
on written health education material as a barrier to information. 
Halcomb et al. [38] suggested that care should be taken to make 
health education material appropriate to fulfil health information 
needs of  a community such as the use of  a local language and il-
lustrations to depict certain messages.

Cultural barriers related to communication about sex-related mat-
ters have been reported as a major obstacle in having open dis-
cussions on sexual and reproductive health in rural communities 
by Lebese [39]. The study showed that cultural values and norms 
hindered sexual health dialogue in communities. It also revealed 
that parents use indirect language to communicate sexual health 
with their children. These barriers result in adolescents lacking the 
information they need to prevent unwanted pregnancies. These 
findings concur with the results found in the current study, as 
the CCWs identified that most parents perceive that talking to 
children about sex-related issues promotes promiscuity amongst 
adolescents and were not willing to talk to their children about 
sex-related issues.

The child support grant was introduced by the government to 
support economically vulnerable and disadvantaged children. This 
grant is payable to a person who takes primary responsibility for 
the daily needs of  a child and need not necessarily be related to 
the child [40]. The CCWs reported that adolescents fall pregnant 
deliberately in order to access the CSG for financial support due 
to their socioeconomic background. Similarly, Kanku and Mash 
[41] reported that child support grants were seen as a means of  
increasing household incomes resulting in teenage pregnancies.
However, Makiwane and Udjo [42] concluded that there was no 
association between the introduction of  the Child Support Grant 
and an increase in adolescent pregnancy in South Africa. The is-
sue of  the influence of  the child support grant is still debatable 
and requires further research.

The current study identified that health-seeking behaviour and 
teenage pregnancy are influenced by a collectivist orientation 
rather than individualist one as it identified the role of  parents 
influencing child behaviour. A study in eastern Uganda related 
teenage pregnancy not so much to the sexual practices of  teenag-
ers as to the failure of  girls’ parents and guardians to educate chil-
dren on sexual and reproductive health issues, which correlates 
to the results found in this study [43]. Similarly Scarinci et al. [44]
highlighted importance of  parents and family members influence 
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in smoking cessation and smoking-prompting behaviour in initia-
tion.

The PEN-3 cultural model was developed by Airhihenbuwa in 
1989 to emphasize the need for cultural appropriateness in devel-
oping, implementing and evaluating public health interventions. 
Cultural context provides a clearer lens through which researchers 
may view and understand behaviour while highlighting important 
variables in future intervention design. Adolescent pregnancy is 
a socially embedded phenomenon and attitudes and actions of  
adolescents are shaped by the environment in which they exist. 
Interventions aimed at reducing adolescent pregnancy in any 
given community should address the broader social environment 
and social norms. Interventions for the reduction and prevention 
of  adolescent pregnancy should be tailored with a sociocultural 
orientation as well as provision of  sexual and reproductive health 
services.

Conclusion

The study was able to identify the socio-economic and cultural 
aspects contributing to adolescent pregnancies in these rural com-
munities. These included perceptions about contraceptive use, 
availability of  sexual and reproductive health services and influ-
ence of  family and peers as the main contributing factors. The 
PEN-3 model provided a framework to assess needs for design-
ing culturally sensitive interventions aimed at preventing adoles-
cent pregnancy. The factors identified will be addressed in the 
development of  culturally sensitive and appropriate health pro-
motion materials through a participatory approach with commu-
nity care workers.
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